
Well-Educated Heart Bingo 

Enrichment: Crafts 
 

Pick a craft to do 

Belmonde: Scandinavia 
 

Listen to a story by 
Hazel Gertrude Kinscella 

and the music there 

Biblioguides/Classic 
WEH Site 

 
Find a poetry book to 
discover new poems 

Classic WEH Website 
 

Read a story from My 
Book House 

FC: Stars 
 

Read some of the 
constellation stories 

and go stargazing 

MLL: Language Arts 
 

Start or continue 
reading Grammarland 

Create a nature journal 
page (I notice, I wonder, 

It reminds me of) 

MLL: Math 
 

Start or continue 
Numbers Stories from 

Long Ago 

Enrichment: SJA 
 

Imitate a Master—try to 
draw a picture you find 

Enrichment: 1500s 
 

Watch a video (or more) 
under music (sea 

shanties, Russian Sailor 
dance) 

FC: Stories and Rhymes 
for Young Children 

 
Memorize a poem 

FC: Imaginative Series 
 

Reenact a fairy tale with 
friends, stuffed animals, 

peg people, etc 

Memorize a poem from 
Golden Staircase (found 

on Internet Archives) 

Biblioguides 
 

Find a picture book to 
read from the Rotation 

topics 

Go for a sense walk 
(what do you see? Feel? 

Hear? Smell? Taste?) 

MLL: Joy 
 

Copy today’s Beautiful 
Thoughts for Happiness 

FC: My Book of Delights 
 

Look through the 
pictures 

Hum a simple song you 
know and try drawing a 
pitch picture (go up on 
paper when the tune 

goes up, etc) 

MU: Nature 
 

Watch an episode of 
JML Nature Journal 
Connection and do 

activity 

Belmonde: Scandinavia: 
Great Lives 

 
Listen to story of 

Thorvaldsen 

Enrichment: Music 
 

Listen to the National 
Anthems for all the 

countries this month 

FC: Poetry for WEH 
 

Find a poem from this 
month topics and make 

a gem page 

Belmonde 
 

Start listening to The 
Golden Name Day and 

find your name day 

Enrichment: Music 
 

Watch a video under 
the Stars topic 

FC 
 

Start or continue 
reading any of the 
Forgotten Classics 

FC: Nature Bundle 
 

Read from Burgess or 
Pierson and make a 

journal page 

MU: Storytelling 
 

Start or continue a 
family story book with 

52 question suggestions 

Enrichment: SJA 
Art memory game: 

Display picture for 30 
seconds, cover it and try 
to write/sketch all you 

remember 

Symphony Stories 
 

Read a story and 
listen/watch the 

song/video 

Enrichment: Food 
 

Find a recipe for a 
poetry tea time treat 

Enrichment: Movies 
 

Watch a musical 
(Moana, King and I, 
South Pacific, etc) 

FC: My Book of Delights 
 

Read through the 
poems 

MASB/MWSB/Podcasts 
 

Listen to a story and 
make a history 
notebook page 

Enrichment: Crafts 
 

Find a star/space craft 
to make 

Find a YouTube video 
and learn how to start 

knitting 

Enrichment: SJA 
 

Find a picture of a 
family to display 


